



Liquid Calcium Chloride Prices

Effective: August 1, 2018-May 31, 2019

LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE: UNINHIBITED		All States Materials Group	Blue Rock Industries	Harcros Chemicals	Innovative Surface Solutions	Maine Salt Company	*Maine Snow & Ice Solutions	MPG	Monson Companies	Paris Farmers Union	Sel Warwick, Inc.	Sicalco Ltd.
500 gallon container	North	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
>1,000 gallon container	North	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.92	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
>2,500 gallon	North	\$1.74	No Bid	\$2.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	\$1.74	No Bid	\$2.37	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Specify larger quantity:	North	\$1.44	No Bid	\$1.43	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	\$1.44	No Bid	\$1.43	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
LIQUID CALCIUM CHLORIDE: INHIBITED												
500 gallon container	North	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.30	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.10	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
>1,000 gallon	North	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.32	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.32	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
>2,500 gallon	North	\$1.84	No Bid	\$2.41	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	\$1.84	No Bid	\$2.41	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Specify larger quantity:	North	\$1.54	No Bid	\$1.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
*see attachments for gallon minimums	South	\$1.54	No Bid	\$1.53	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.70	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

All prices per gallon

*Maine Snow & Ice Company: Refundable \$50.00 deposit for totes